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1. Product Name 

MacroTint and MiniTint 
 

2. Manufacturer 

WOOD KOTE PRODUCTS INC 
8000 NE 14th Pl (97211) 
PO Box 17192 
Portland OR 97217 
Tel: (800) 843-7666 (USA & Canada) 
Tel: (503) 285-8371 
Fax: (503) 285-8374 
info@woodkote.com 
www.woodkote.com 
 

3. Product Description 

BASIC USE 

MacroTint and MiniTint are intended 
for professional use only. These are 
hand-held devices designed for 
extremely accurate measurement 
and dispensing of liquid colorants. 
They may be used to accurately 
measure and dispense any liquid 
colorant, flatting agent or additive. 
 

ADVANTAGES 

 Accurate 

 Durable 

 Portable 
 

COMPOSITION & PROPERTIES 

MacroTint and MiniTint are 
machined from aircraft-grade 
aluminum, anodized and laser 
etched. Calibration bar attached with 
stainless steel set screws. Cylinder 
bore is within 0.003 inches of the 
piston diameter. Solvents commonly 
associated with interior wood 
finishes should not affect the 
anodized surfaces. 
 

TYPES 

MacroTint has a maximum 
dispensing volume of 5-fl oz (148 ml) 
and is calibrated in increments of 1/4 
fl oz (7,4 ml). 

 
MiniTint has a maximum dispensing 
volume of 1-fl oz (29,6 ml) and is 
calibrated in increments of 1/48 fl oz 
(0,6 ml). 
 

SIZES 

MacroTint is sold in 5-fl oz (148 ml) 
size and MiniTint is sold in 1-fl oz 
(29,6 ml) size (see types). 
 

4. Technical Data 

PHYSICAL PROPERTIES 

Weight: 
MacroTint 34 oz (964 gm) 
MiniTint 6.2 oz (175,8 gm) 

 

5. Installation 

No installation is required. MacroTint 
and MiniTint are ready to use out of 
the package. Hold the device upright 
with the measurement numbers 
facing toward you. Grasp the piston 
at the bottom and turn until the 
calibration bar is aligned over the 
measurement numbers. Pull the 
piston down until the point at the end 
of the calibration bar reaches the 
desired increment, and then turn the 
piston ¼ of a turn to lock it in place. 
Place the device on a horizontal 
surface and fill the cylinder space 
with the appropriate liquid up to the 
top rim, immediately pour the liquid 
into the proper receptacle while 
turning the piston to align the 
calibration bar over the 
measurement numbers. Push the 
piston to the top of the cylinder. 
Liquid remaining on the piston head 
should be removed with a metal 
scraper. 
 

CLEAN UP 

MacroTint and MiniTint should be 
cleaned after each usage. The piston 
should be removed from the cylinder 
and all surfaces should be cleaned 
with a soft cloth and the proper 
solvent. Colorants should be 
removed from the devices with 
LaqThin T-99A (lacquer thinner). 
Other materials may best be 
removed with alternative solvents 
such as mineral spirits or detergent 
and water. 
 

 

6. Availability & Cost 

AVAILABILITY 

MacroTint and MiniTint are available 
through recognized Wood Kote 
retailers or directly from the 
manufacturer. A list of stocking 
dealers is available from the 
manufacturer and can be found on 
the manufacturer’s web site. 
 

COST 

Cost information is available from 
recognized Wood Kote retailers or 
from the manufacturer. 
 

7. Warranty 

MacroTint and MiniTint are 
warranted to be free from defects in 
materials and workmanship. Under 
normal usage and conditions these 
products should perform indefinitely. 
These products may be purchased 
for inspection and trial usage with a 
60-day money back guarantee. 
Contact the manufacturer for 
complete details and return policy. 
 

8. Maintenance 

ADJUSTMENT 

From time to time the calibration bar 
on a MacroTint or MiniTint may 
become bent and lack sufficient 
friction to hold the cylinder in place. 
This may be corrected by removing 
the 2 stainless steel set screws that 
attach the calibration bar, very gently 
bending the bar in a slight arc in the 
direction of the piston and then re-
attaching it. 
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Wood Kote, Lite-N-Up, WoodPerfect, WoodBuddy, W-F-C, SprayLaq, KatLaq, Trans Kote, Jel'd Stain, Liqwid Stain, Dye Stain, Glaze Kote, BrushLaq, Jel'd Poly Kote, Ultra Poly Kote, 
Flagship, FloorEver, Clear and Clean, X-Link-R, MacroTint & MiniTint, Korrect-O, Perfecto-O, LaqFlat, PolyFlat, LaqAdd, LaqThin, WashThin, AceThin, PolySolvent, Sta-Wax, Lin Soap, C-U-2 
are registered trademarks or trade-names of Wood Kote Products Inc. 

 

9. Technical Services 

MacroTint or MiniTint should not 
require technical service or 
assistance. Contact the 
manufacturer if you have questions 
or require additional information. The 
manufacturer provides starting tint 
formulas, which are available on the 
manufacturer’s web site. 
 

10. Filing Systems 

 Wood Kote–Product Catalog 

 Additional product information is 
available from the manufacturer. 

 www.woodkote.com 
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